:

BCERIVE

CORBIN BOARD OF EDUCATION
STANDARD INVOICE

SER 2 8 2018
W e serw \
Name of Vendor: |A HASAN DAVIS
Address: -
Invoice Description &
Number  Invoice Date Purchase Order #
PFE092518- |
CRBN 9/252018 | CONTRACT SERVICE
SPEAKER
I hereby certify that the above is a correct statement of

amount due from the above
for articles

s furnished or services rendered ag itemized.

——_Signed:

f

By:

Named board of ‘education

G

| Vendor# s 10169 5 o
City ~ State Zip Code
Object Project
OrgCode Code Code Invoice Amount
2118 349 S)¥EN s 1,500.00
—_— — .
S _ -
“HT B —— ——
, Progr_aLn_:\»’_ﬂ_ _PROMISE NEIGHBORHOOD

{\Check\Nqu

445-9305G8Y
igfhlﬁm—se@qa

$1,500.00V

/



Invoice for Services
Date September 25,2018

Invoice # PFEQ925 18-CRBN

FROM: A.Hasan Davis
308 Apache Drive
Paint Lick, Ky 40461
Email: info@hasandavis.com
Phone: 859 200-059g

TO: Partners For Education at Bereg College

ATTN: Melinda V. Philpot
Promise Schoo| Coordinator
Corbin Elementary
Corbin Intermediate

melinda.ghilgot@berea.edu

Description of Fees and Services m
\Honomrium
Elementary, Intermediate Middle School Presentations (9-25-2018 $1,500.00

Related Expenses

Hasan Davis will assumes all t
Corbin, KY, including
Additional Expenses
No additional fees Or expenses

ravel related cost from Paint Lick KY to
: Ground Trans portation, and Per Diem,

$1,500.00

Please make check Payable to: Hasan Dayvis at Above address

The only people that we cannot reach are those we refuse to touch.
~Hasan Davis



9/27/2018 Corbin Independent Schools Mail - FW: Hasan Davis invoice
w5

F i)

Deanna Darr <deanna.darr@corbin.kyschools.us>

FW: Hasan Davis invoice
2 messages

Amanda G. Smith <Amanda_Smith@berea.edu> Wed, Sep 26, 2018 at 8:01 AM
To: Deanna Darr <Deanna.darr@corbin.kyschools.us> '

Deanna,

See attached invoice for Melinda’s speaker from yesterday. 'm not sure if there is 3 PO for this, or if he needs a Wg?

From: Melinda V. Philpot

Sent: Wednesday, September 26, 2018 1:25 AM

To: Amanda G. Smith <Amanda_Smith@berea.edys
Subject: Hasan Davis invoice

Amanda,

Attached is Hasan Davis’s invoice.
Thank you,

Melinda V. Philpot

Promise School Coordinator

Corbin Elementary

Corbin Intermediate

Partners For Education at Berea College

melinda.philpot@berea.edu

. = e S = e ———— et e, e e e

From: Hasan Davis <hasandavis.solutions@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 25, 2018 11:12 PM

To: Melinda V. Philpot

Subject: Re: Speaking to CMS, CIS and CES

Hi Melinda,

https://mail.goog le.com/mail/u/0%ik=e2798ef8 be&view=pt&sea rch=all&permthid=th read-f%3A161267141 3278203427&sim pl=msg-f%3A161267141327.__ 1/3



Hasan

Thank you so much for Speaking with the students at CMS, CIS ang CESto
shared with oyr students. We appreciate You and your time at the Corbin S¢

earliest convenience,
Have a great day!
Melinda v. Philpot

Promise Schogj Coordinator

Corbin Elementary

Corbin Intermediate

Partners For Education at Berea College

melinda.philpot@berea.edu

2 attachments
/\\_,.
S
- . 1
Partners for Education

BERIA o LEGE
a1y 09 25 2018 Invoice Corbin ele.docx
@ 27K

Outiook-151 6294589.png

I did not have g purchase order byt | will get one signed by Dave and I do need g w-

Deanna Darr
Grant Facilitator

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/O?ik=e27QBef8bc&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-

day. So many great inspirationa Mmessages
hools. Please send over an invoice at your

Thu, Sep 27, 2018 at 8:54 AM

9. Thanks!

f%3A161267141327820342_2&simpl=msg~f%3A1612671 41327... 213



Purchase Order
Corbin Independent Schools

po.# LOOBET

T
77
JaSooa)  Na \;‘zh- ‘L

N )
To: I - JL 4 {1
Py
Bill | Ship. .
3 }D Location:
to: lo: VOTES 27, ol
Corbin Independent Schools
108 Roy Kidd Avenue, Corbin KY 40701 ; ;
(606)528-1303  Fax [606]523-1747 Bill | sh P Location:
Attention to: to: fo:
Corbin High School Corbin Preschool Center
1901 Snyder Street, Corbin KY 40701 614 Master Street, Corbin KY 40701
(606)528-3902 Fax [606]523-3627 (606)523-3612  Fax [606]523-3618
Attention to: Attention to:
Corbin Middie School Corbin Center for Technology & Community Activities
706 South Kentucky Avenue, Corbin KY 40701 222 Corbin Center Drive, Corbin KY 40701
(606)523-3619  Fax [606]523-3621 (606)261-7739 _ Fax [606]261-7807
Attention to; Attention tox, | 'z g/
Corbin Intermediate School Technology Building
404 West 17th Street, Corbin KY 40701 11 Casey Karr Drive, Corbin KY 40701
(606)528-1651 Fax [606]523-3615 (606)528-9150  Fax [606]528-9150
Afttention to: Attention to:
Corbin Elementary School Corbin Educational Center
710 West 8th Street, Corbin KY 40701 901 South Main Street, Corbin KY 40701
(606)528-4367  Fax [606]523-3606 (606)528-4080  Fax [606]523-3614
Attention to: Attention to:
Corbin Primary School Kentucky Tech Corbin ATC
3551 5th Street Road, Corbin KY 40701 1909 South Snyder Street, Corbin KY 40701
(606)523-3638 Fax [606]523-3640 (606)528-5338  Fax [606]528-0532
Attention to: Attention to:
Please accept an order for the following items, NO BACK ORDERS ACCEPTED: Kentucky sales tax exemption number C779
[purchase | [account code )
method*] number] quantity catalog number description unit cost amount
i : Coato L\ feo e €
{ [T
21
office use onl . AT 5
[l ! estimated shipping and handling
* Purchasing Methods:
A. Co-op Bids TOTAL | oo
B. Corbin Board of Education Bids/Contracts L=
C. Catalog or Store Discount Pricing - Board Approved
D. State Price Contracts
E. Noncompetitive Negotiation - List option - Provide expianation for option 11:
F.  Small Purchase Agreement - Describe reason: .
—_—_— e ¢ LT ]
o i~ ) I \ L - L %4
Program: _ VPR ooy wzad ! ! 2t 0 Yo A\ 5T :\“‘_-' TS U« O I
: 3 requisitioner’s signature date
gram coordinator date

Copies:  white copy to vendor
canary copy to business department
pink copy maintained for your files
goldenrod copy submitted with invoice for payment

approved b’):‘priﬁcjpal/pro
L4

/ e A { 'Efﬂ;;’ v [t

superintendent’s signature for orders $1,000 and over date




